0H0 R ™~ dft-sRey ger-11 2019
" I gfore wETe,
TROFOTHO Wt )

= R : TEs: st 5,2019
Rrg: S w9 STEE) (GMe) ARFEE-2017 F WA # oA wrdare!
greTd &8 1 % T 71

e e e T o

IETV Y39 ST (Gee) SnfE-2017(2018 @ Siffaa wear-4) ant
o9 S, GYFT A SRRl SifiET-1910 & AT mReer § [BE T
qeEql TIMIT OF gRasT @ T g soh-if o &) &y & 7 afed gewen
% e g @ @ @ 7 Frfd BT o g9 s @ i #r ey @
F W@ B @ STUTT [T 8, il §RT F 39 FHX F qeAred # gAagaT
T &l

ST G # T ST GO AT F AR G e T F o ) 8,
qanfeT ST % gifaer % 59| Rfkedr frag 8-

2. 39 gotyT fET T ga ST @ gRI-50,51,52,53,54,55 gg 60 H
qeerT G qRIET FXP ST PG B AT B G & HITTT B GHT FXA qrd
# ot qvg F1 qPfere g T 8, g & R grren F affa sy @
S7er faare 9aTT #vd §9 @8 @9 gHi & A 7 A ifvafs @ T 81

3. gqFT g oIEErd dREF-1910 @ qa S F err-60 & gsEng
yRT-60¢ gt T 8, Foras el B qew gard ® fE o s ar R
77 @ oY FX 8 [T [ S 4 9 fraer @ g9 srvrasy gerl # fma
FC 7 g & g garT #3, forad qrg @l fAwarTar @ Svefd ar g 3vsfor
T gg I T Fig IR &l G TR &, % ke Frer-e 398 #r ggeee
FXd g4 g &9 7 HAilaT AT T % % @ ST B4 a # WA Ay
T 21

4. 7T STHMET # ETT-60,62,63,64,64T,65,66,67,68 §F 69 § FYEfT g8
qEr & Afigle @ T & T grr-70,71,74 ug 74T F ft g Bar @y &4
4gT-72 % IYENT-2 % T GT 73 SUYRT Sowenfia et T 81 siaeq @ arr-3
b @vs-12 3 FvEvs-F(1) F At gataT fRer o &1 59 g & gve-12 #

Scanned by CamScanner




v SYGUS-2 F RRT FT R T & qur syave-4 F gus gifaerT feEr @ &1 g7

it # arr-28 @ Gvar-1 @ o7 7 Wegw (Proviso) @t g #d g4
SYUIRT-3 7 4 &t FfT #¢ faar @ 81

¥ oy w8 B AT @ 3w @y sfufET @ mEerE & -
TEET FT T O o T B AEN R & Edl o7 ot oriTed
AR /TR & @rg @F=d #%a gd T NSl & HEeTT FXG0H0
W{#ﬁw}wﬁﬁw%%mﬁwwy#%m—wwwﬂm

FUITT FHUA ST GHRET F 1

Q% TEIT |

. a4,
(sitodo i)

g aive g o/ gierd orefer,

T4 TR,

ket UM

1. gl #ETfee®, SiETT, 050 /

2. &YX Yfer eI, SR, 00 TETS |

3. GRS S YT g AellasrE, 3050 1

4. gueT GREAT G AR,/ FTEIIEE, 3050 |

Scanned by CamScanner




BH-HE—~
1 FFRTE TR-GHRTHAo / To—

Sade / Flofio—91 /201418

RN T U YT wd e

HER] TE, aﬁwé‘sr

Wﬁ&ﬁummmﬁm

. s . i

AT

e aRRre
ARI—1, e ()
- (SR e rferfeem)

G, AR, 6 SIaYl, 2018
oIy 16, 1930 WIH THI

IR URY A
fqemdy srgHT—1

Te&r 2731/ 79-f-1-17-1{#)-20-17
TS, 6 AL, 2018

- STfeREE
fafae
"R BRI @ SR 200 B A OUTR HEIRY A R 9eU JEER) (Eee)
e, 2017 R AT 5 wAR, 2018 @ AR wam @1 olk @ SR wew s W
¥ 2016 @ wu & GIAMRY % gurd g0 aitmgEe e yarl fha S 8

IR YR FEHEN) (FeEE) HeUE, 2017
(SR W Sffrm e 4 ¥ 2018)
[Orer SaR wRw R wvsa g wilka 53
ST o S AR, 1910 B TR HluA B F R
s
Hva MRSy @ orewsd ad A Preferiea afigs whim SRY R
1-(1) TE fFEm SER wed wafﬁrﬁ (wiehue) affram, 2017 weE W@ A

L]

S | . :
(2) TE 27 =R, 2017 B G g THH A |

796 RPH adbiniyam 4 2018_Deta 6 Vidhaika Folder

Scanned by CamScanner




mmwmtm 2018

wgw A

W 4 G

1910 3 G
3 T WA

s ST SR, 1910, maﬁwmﬁ“mm*

aﬁ’lmsa‘»m(ﬁ)ﬂ-
(@) STEve (1)
v R o,
(@) swavs (2) Fra far sm;
(wr)m@)a!wrawmﬁrmamwfmmm— .
(4)aﬁ§mmwﬁmmmmmm
alrwfr mift a1 '
3~1aaxfhﬁmaﬂamzaﬁm(s)t{a(4)m1m2"‘”?
foyarett N W af

—ﬁmmwmmﬁmmm%mﬁﬁmmm
fear s, spif -

fr qE & B BT 1 o, 2016 W SRR SRV e (W)
RN, 2017 B WRW BN & e e wwwd afacid Yo, amze%az&hﬂ
TAE YOS AT TR |

570 affrgm o g 50 -

(@) T "W T FHT B WH W AR QTR T B

wwe i geRe s gor @ R S,

(@) T T oF UR 60" D WM W YK W HH "HWI 60,

aRT 605" ¥ fad W | ,

' tgaarféﬁmuﬁammﬁmaﬁimmﬁm% P W R TR
ﬁawmgmmmmm% T VR T IE URT 60"
B WM R L @ oI “UR 60, T 60F” ¥ &Y A |

73 SfFRT # gv 52 § wE TE o "GRT 607 T WM R ¥R Ud
3i® "9IRT 60, HIT 603" ¥@ A W .

a3 SR A ari 63 ¥, a8 @ AP URT 607 %wwmw
P "I 60, UNT 60%" & fad WG|

%wmﬁﬂm&ﬁmmﬁwwm
st wve v fRar s, sl

qfta U8 & 5 9INT €0, HIRT 60%, SNY €1, URT 62, HINT 63, ORT 645,
a1 65, GRT 68 B I TV Al SN Jrerar Sa gl & anfie fRi
SR F IRV B RR Tty Rl sew w1 aRww, R R Afeie @
amen R Rear o g@a & R 0 f5 ORI 61 WA MRT 52 @ AN FeIR W
T R M A are w1 Froee, Al 3 afer g Ren e @
o Bordex R 90 waom @ foll mifvga e w1

107 IRFTE A oW 55 B W R Prefafee v v @ o,
et~ ‘

“55 ORI 60 N SYHN (2), UINT 60%, HRI 62, €T 63, HRI 64% R ol
gl @ el ) oy B gERv @ R B o R, 3ve wRR
<X, 1073 & sreifrfa orvAERa g1 I -

11-1amﬁwaﬁamw$wmmﬁmmamwﬂmﬁ1ﬁ
arerfe—

w(1)sﬁmﬁimﬁawmﬁmqmmmm}wﬁmm
MY et agde w5 g, WRE T O @ Seere we -
(@) f5d wes oy & Fraia oean 8; s

) % ww R @ e %WWW 1 R

Scanned by CamScanner




AT TR

TRR TV YR To7e, 6 TR, 2018

(@) 70 JRPIH B g 63 3 o orTIen [ MEe awy
¥ aReE v @ a1 SR TR A @ s

(M) wuaw ey R #= pod oen! affygm, 1985 3 anfm
BT o, mon @ R s aes el ¥ B rghe v v
ST At G ARAD O (@Hw Jerga) B O A oRaa @k o
mmmmmﬁmmﬂﬁg)mmmﬁm
Fw B; Jrerar

(@) B e “oaree, Rfmfrerer o1 g it s
g @ gem R

(®) fo® woR @ B WEE, wiE, a9, SR @ guate, @)
W = e Tee a)] @ Rfw @ s @ RN sgm v & @
A U T AT e A NG B; R

(@) v aRfraw & ofm wgew @, caRa ar R AR
e, arde, fafireer, FMmE @ uerR /B ARES
a%] &I &; arerar

(U)hma%nmaﬁmmrhmﬁmﬁﬁm?;
Jer

(W) 41 61 ERY SE T @ R 5 wee aw) @ ey
w8 3

(y)mna%mhasdﬁq&me}aﬁmé’rﬁmm#maﬁﬁﬁqaﬁ
R, g @, o e @
tth%aﬁeaﬁmwr&mmﬁm()%mﬁaMmaﬁ
Refd # <1 od & & wom & ok gl | e frw FAT W e FAR W

g Rufdy & wrem | sed fear smm ot &9 of
mwﬁm%aﬁ?@qmﬁ@aﬁsﬁmmmmwﬁ
AqeF IR B GaU § 39 affram ok agdw s
| B AFER T aedE w R aRdw, Wi o

FTER T @ T B @ mvﬁ'ag‘rcﬂ B TH [ A D FAR B9

@)mﬁéwmmﬁqﬁqmﬂﬁmﬁmmﬁﬁﬁ&m
u 3 Wffm @ sl mr Rl A, Wit @ oW @1 It wee, R
e geg @ Pt &ven 2, IN IREW S B AW ® FW A8 # o & A
of aw 8 Wt & @ gus R SR A uR oEt @ gve few e o
dfu FoR TR E H T B R T T8 E I98 a6 & wwar d
@) 9 % zw offrw w ol T M R Prow @ R M
IRY F IeAd IS A TS WY B IW wNen B 9 G w T
TR A e TR G0 R HA AR Ern o O 8 EeIR v0 O @ wadn 21
12-7w sfafras @ ura e0 @ vvEw Pl o wg @ @R,
YT -
Creom-u PR R wew oo @ R s wend w Rwrda
ey T ¥ SW UUER Iww eq MW awa @ our fBfdm
oy 701 W & W W s wew W W A o
%%Wmﬂm%fhma@cﬂmﬂwm
@ R 7ol fahg oW R, S WM owal € W fmg awarm @ @
i T W} w e avam 2 RRR W @
T Ry (A@ATal A 9UER @ ER SURfY W ey w S I

?wmmg ol aft BT wefad B, @ eftea Rear S -
@ ford
mia

796_RFH _adhiniyam ¢_2C18_Data 6 Vidnaka Folder

T¥ UR 60
T QTG ATH

Scanned by CamScanner




(@) df<
arehas SRE AR TE,
T eqd | B 7 B, @ R of I A

(@)uﬁ@ﬁmm%mf&mﬂmmw
a}mﬁﬁaﬂmmwmmﬁmaﬂﬁw
u:aﬁﬂmam,amrgw?mﬁvhdﬁmmawﬁm?,
ﬁﬁj‘cﬁﬂﬁmm'ﬁmﬂsﬁm,

(n)uﬁ@@wﬁmﬁn@wﬁmﬁwﬁmﬁrmﬁém
oRur) R T 2, o Oe ol B aware & o @ at @ @ wed
é%ﬁwﬁémammwamaﬁmmmm
aF 2 W & g U g el gk Ul A @ T 8

G378 U Dy ue guefr @ “ER wuEf 3 aef @@
gt ot wdrT Tve Wi, 1860 (WP WwUT 45§ 1860) PN RN U 319

' vd 320 A 81"
uT 62 Pl 13—%&@%@@%62*‘??@"%%@@%8@6@%
W & g & Tvedn A @ WM W wE g @ o 9t suR ol W A
. 81 BT ok o <@ TR S @@ & G & qvedd BT ¥ el S |
uRT 63 T 14—¢aaﬁzﬂwaﬂmsazﬁwmwﬁﬁfﬁ=ﬁﬁﬁmwﬁmﬁvﬁ,
woaA rerfy

‘g3~ By Al = PR a1 agd TR Rl fram ar
mow g @ Y M PRl ordw @ SowEd WS J HY H
?mgﬁ .‘mmﬁv@rr,gﬁ@m@'m&wﬂ,ﬁh
URT 30 B oMM SR Yed T ARwd Yo B g I, af feRh
A v @ WA § g9 oRfre o agEm TR M frae ok fR

M ey & JgER U IgHE T w@EE, Wit 710, 3 FGER
TR @ T A & gETech 9, @ g6 A a9 seR ow, o
) o 2, A 7% 78 B, e R TR
I 64 BT 15— SRFRE @ gR 64 wuS (M) B W W PR wve @
e foan SR, aRaf -

~(1) SR A, R R ura 6o ¥ ueE 8, @ e el S o
40 Td 41 @ ol @R T RE Prus @1 SHge IR SoEEA aRal € 9N NS

- 0 oy @ R ML, W1 Us EOR T8 9§ @ Ad @ sk Wl it EWR
’ TR gF B T L, ¥ aivead e e
O 64 B 16—7t ARFEH B a1 64w -

e ’

(@) wuu (1) fRara € smad;

(@) SR () ¥ v T FOR T’ W WM W ¥ UG AR

() TN (2) B WgE A UK QA W I B HE R TE A
R FIA” AU I U 6 eud” B WM W e “dF R 9l @

fed o |
awI 65 B 177 s & ur 65 # -
A
(@) SR (1) A U= v AR B WM W TR TH ay’ Tl u"
"2 TR T’ B W R @ ifE guR v Y@ fad S,
(@ SR (2 A W& Ut W T @ WM W UL UH ER
o v R s ' .
U 66 T 18- RPEm B art 66 F v WA AET D WM R 7R TH ai”

wehuA dur T dfE W ol @ v W e dhE BOR O YW@ fRd St

Scanned by CamScanner



TER TV IRV THE, 6 SHaN), 2018 5
19—1aaﬂﬁmaﬁms7ﬁm"mﬁﬂr?'$wmwma'wa€“-nmeran

T e e | W D M W e R SU v 3 oinh e
» zo—u;aarﬁzﬁma%umsaﬂm “gla W TR’ B W R g dfg o es @
BUR ¥9 v f3d | WA

21-7d IR ) avr e A, e TRTEG @ve ¥ v AE A B uwee @
WH W IK (@ I T O 0 g D wH R U Q) af v Ry oy e
22— ARFRET & Wrieo T W AR 3R AF “URT 60 W IULRT R 69 B
(1) W SR (2) B v () W¥E (m), wve () W wWve (B) W uw ez @ ¥
%mwwaﬂ?w*‘v{mmmeommszmeammﬂssw -
A wr dad
23—138&%@%70#— ‘ R 70 @l
Wt
(as)m(ﬁﬁ woe (6) B WM W FEfafea @vs @ R
arﬁmam”rq

(m)wmmmmaammm

e g uRare o1 Rod 3 fea oy, =T 60, URT 60 @,

URT 62, UTRT 63, R 64 &, UINT 65 T R 69 W@ @ nfiA vy
el TR @ are

_ (@) IWRT (2) B W\ W Frafeien Swuw w@ € SR, Juf-

i | - () Wou EXER @ Ry Wl @ fam e Afwge, ur

o
o 8
-
\
)
1
X
3
%
*
4
‘.
J.
3

60 B W YR (¥) T (W) (4 UNT 67 @ N f6Y A rerar
e fod goRa Mm%ﬁﬂww@ﬁm &
Fedin 5l sy @ W9 @@ 9o 98 @ e a9 b
afwer, 9w Revm, R RAvis @) euue fra o afsfa
g1, @ wyarq ¢ & 9rw | Wi By wma e
24~ M & R 71 H - mm

BT AT ST avos

B et AR
LT

(®) & IR I® “URT 60" @ WM W Y& AR 3@ N 60,
e 80w T fod o,

(ﬂ)mﬁﬂ?ﬁm’?ﬁwwﬁmﬁﬁﬁwﬁrmmmw1m

feay wrrm, st -

"afyam g8 ¥ 5 9R1 60w T ORI 69w ¥ fr @@ @
. AR B g9 arole aovdl § = Rl wfdm o gEt
3 A afwd @ Riara BRER 1 3ve T W

! - 26—01 FRFEM. N gr1 72 § SR (2) B W R e gyw aR 2 @
1 w € o, s e
i . ' (2)@3@&@%@%%%%%%@31@@
e, R afury @ fFAega @ R @ @9 o fiaw @ AR,
1 : afevy g e RO Soidey @ WHE Wgd &0 | deraes Al
ST ofr frdla TR wRa Sw RO e a W aeee wi@ @)
‘ RfEE offRen iR SR By AMe¥ <, W fh @y Sfea wwel ol
IffaRea A o Tl BRET / FoTeR B T8 wHYE @ 9 & o
v fear T @ fwe BRO -GN R @1 9y SUEN (1) @ S
FfeRy 5 O @1 T B T R @ T WA avg W 0y @ IR
B B ARY 2 FEHAl & AR QW B ford afvarem wRera e
T A W A fFw T

sfgw gz & 5 Swm (1) ¥ fffe fed o (e axg @
oreey) a1 oy @ Rufy & swe =M o e Rew R W & 3
IED AET B T W I AR AR o @ RAls @ IWd
IR o0 B 3RF JHA B P W, A vy wafa 'm0

796_RPH_adhimyam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaika Folder

Scanned by CamScanner



U 73 & @ 2

"73m—mﬁ_m72mam73$mﬁémmaﬂmﬁm
maﬁﬁaﬁmmwﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁmﬁmmm
ﬁmﬁmﬁm@mmmmmma@g
awrgr ofy RERT B TR D aw] D g aiegr uRvEa w81 fa
mm%.awwmﬂﬁmEMma%Wsﬁﬁgﬁzﬁ
mmmzﬁwmaﬁwmam%:

. °W<w%ﬁ5mmmwmmaﬁﬁmﬂaﬁ
ﬂmaﬁwﬁ$mﬁzﬁmmmﬁmﬁw'¢mzﬁm
Fﬁmﬂmﬁmm%@wﬁﬂ-w,wmﬁwgﬁ;ﬁmm
e 3 R T3w B AR @ R SR 8, e T R S

SR HR TE & 5 g @ el e avg e fed o Ry
mm,wwm,mm@mmmmma
@ 7 B @ Afew D Tra g B aaey war fRd Re o
forgr Smm:
e T R e A TG @1 iE T W S 9
o @ Ror aReRr fRsar ST I |
bbb 2777 S A e 74 -

() saRt (1) § T i EER PH B WM W AR TEE
(@) IGURT (1-3) A~
TR Td e T (F) B AN B WM W UK T AR
"gog (@) T (@) & e @ fad S, ‘
W@ s o9 o A § TR ae B w9 2 @ W R
yE “TE B9R Ul o U gWR w9d a% 8 §adl 87 v fd
; ST |
o 7T T 26—t RPN aw 74 ¥ g (1) ¥ wee “dfg gOR TR @
Sucell WH T Y& U6 @ R I Rl e o
. fiem ofR 20-(1) TER VT PN (HANH) LA, 2017 TIERT Soulectd
R P foman o &1 ﬁ
s Q) % P @ @R Y R S () F Affe ST TR z0n
aen WG e ofifraw @ Swedl @ e g@ Y e W B TR
P priad), za oRPRE g vl Wi q@ afPeE @ W
yeoefl Sueel @ ol @ W @ A wRe S A gw et
D Iuey @ §RAM g A yge 9

I R BRI

osu A T @R R D grerd ameer R gER wed w91 R @1 ad 2016-17 A
STEER BT g AT 14272 e wWd wATRia fr) o) et A FuiRa @ & e @
mmﬁmrmmmwmmm,ﬁmgﬁumﬁmmﬁm
§1 90 woR ¥ T A oy AR @ ey @ % dow ww @ v A a4 gd ) aw o
A T e RN B U @ BRY wA.od @ afy @ gy A 8 ol | sreer wrE
Q W T HeAsl ol ora NSl @ fraryr B @ SEavd @ T Rftvwn frw T &

g o e PR, 1010 § Weim ave gem: Pl Swaw s

(1) ST aRfTa @ wftes Suet @) s AfE Fe fear @,

Scanned by CamScanner



- s T
i i et

SO FANATRT

t
i

SR TRV SN To7e, 6 TGN, 2018
(2) wftss B B SR Pow @ wa } T DA o7 S 16T o,

(B)sene yor A sfemm W R afud SgEl @ A 1 e, 2016 @ WA
fvar S

. ]
) Em iR R T wert sfframicss 4 Wi R oY @ aww
HIT 7T TSI AR, 1910 |§ X Q@ MO W W SR B Praren oL
(5) =ite® il § SRR F wiwfera Rrar o

g wvn Rum woew w3 § 98 w1 ok @i Rfvea @ 9 w3 3 ) e
femh Frfadl w3 sEEE o, a6 voEE g REie 27 RiaRR, 2017 B IER R
TN (HEI) LAY, 2017 (SRR WA FATRY WET 1 W 2017) FEAMa R war|

T Reew e s 3 s wd @ R e R w2

TSN @,
IR FAR A,
T wg |

No. 2731(2)/LXXIX-V-1-17-1(ka)-20-17
Dated Lucknow, January 6,2018
IN pursuance of the provisions of clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution, the Governor is

pleased to order the publication of the following English translation of the Uttar Pradesh Aabkari

(Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2017 (Uttar Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 4 of 2018) as passed by the Uttar
Pradesh Legislature and assented to by the Governor on January 5, 2018.

THE UTTAR PRADESH EXCISE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2017
* (U.P. ACTNO.4 0F2018)
(As passed by the Uttar Pradesh Legislature]
AN
ACT ‘
" further to antend the United Provinces Excise Act,1910.
ITIS HERI::E),’_ enacted in the Sixty-eighth Year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Act, 2017.  Short title end
; ! C Y
(2) It shali be deemed to have come into force on September 27, 2017. ommencemant

2. Insection 3 of the United Provinces Excise Act, 1910 hereinafter referred to as Amendment of
the principal Act, in clause (12),- section 3 of

: S . . U.P. Actno 4
“. (a) in sub-clause (i) for the words "Sidhi or Ganja" the words "or sidhi" of 1910
shall be substituted,

(b) sub-clause (ii) shall be omitred;
(c) for clause (iv) the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

"(iv) any other intoxicating substance which the State Government
may by notification declare to be an intoxicating drug;".

3. In section 28 of the principal Act, sub-sections (3) and (4) shall be deemed to  Amendment of

have been omitted from April 1, 2016. section 28
4. In section 30 of the principal Act, in subssection (1) the following proviso shall Amendmentof
be inserted at the end, namely:— section 30

"Provided that consideration fee levied from 01 April, 2016 upto the date of
commencement of the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 shall be
deemed to be Excise Duty under section 28",

796 RPH adhinivem & More oo oo

Scanned by CamScanner




8

e F34 SR TS, 6 T, 2018

Amendment
of section 50

Amendment
of section 51

Amendment
of section 52

Amendment
of section 53

Amendment
of section 54

Amendment
of section 55

Amendment
of section 60

i fthe principal Act, - . =
5 s(ez::)[;;nr ir?cowlrdf "confmilting an offence”the words "committing or abetting '}
an offence”shall be substituted
(b) for the word and figures "sec
section 60A" shall be substituted. _ "
6. In section 51 of the principal Att for the words ."comrmttcd any _offencﬁ the
words "committed or abetted any offence” and for the word and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall Pc substituted. )
7. In section 52 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A" shall be substituted.
8. In section 53 of the principal Act for the words and figures "section 60" the
words and figures "section 60, section 60A " shall be substituted.
9. In section 54 of the principal Act for the proviso the following proviso shall be
substituted, namely:-

vProvided that an offence punishable under section 60, section 60A, section 61,

~section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65, section 68 or an offence punishable for
ated into without the order of a

abetment of any offence under the said sections may be investig
Magistrate, and that any warrant issued by the Collector under section S1 or section 52 may be
executed by any officer authorised by the Collector for the said purpose.”

10, For section 55 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,

tion 60"the words and figures “section 60,

namely:-
"55. All offences punishable under sub-section (2) of section 60, section 60A,

"section 62, section 63, section 64-A and any offence punishable for abetment of any

offence under the said sections, shall be non-bailable within the meaning of the Code of
Criminal Procedure, 1973." ,
11. For section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted, .
namely:- ‘
60, (1) Whoever, in Contravention of this Act or of any rule or order made
thereunder, or of any licence, permit or pass obtained thereunder:—
(a) exports any intoxicant; of
(b) transports or posse3sci any intoxicant which is not covered under
section 63 of this Act; or .
(c) collects or sells the leaves and smali stalks (not accompanied by
flowering or fruiting tops) of natural and spontanecus growth of ‘wild Indian
Hemp plant (Cannabis Sativa) other than charas, ganja or any other intoxicating
drug covered under the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances Act, 1985;
or,
(d) constructs or works any distillery, brewery, manufactory or vintnery; or
(¢) uses, keeps or has in his possession any material, still, utensil,
implement or apparatus, whatsoever, for the purpose of manufacturing any
intoxicant other than tari; or
(f) removes any intoxicant from any distillery, brewery, manufactory,
vintnery or warehouse licenced, established or continued under this Act; or
(g) bottles any liquor for the purposes of sale; or
(h) sells any intoxicant, save in the case provided for by section 61; or
(i) taps, or draws tari from any tari-producing tree in the areas notified
under section 42 ; .
shatl be punished with imprisonment which may extend to two years and with
fine which may extent to one thousend rupees in the case of an offence under sub
clause (i) and in any other case, with imprisonment which may extend to three
years and with fine which shall, not be less than ten times of the amount of
consideration fee or duty which would have been leviable if such intoxicant had
been dealt with in accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made

196_RPH_adhiniyam 4_2018_Data 6 Vidhaiks Folder

Scanned by CamScanner




e et

PR e

———

N esemnesntestensitle

TER W IR To7e, 6 Aas), 2018

thereunder or in accordance with any licence, permit or pass obtained

thereunder, or two thousand rupees whichever is greater.

: (2) Whoever in contravention of this Act or any rule or order made thereunder
or of any li

licence, permit or pass, obtained under this Act, manufactures any intoxicant

shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less than six months and which
may extend to three yéars and also with fine which shall not be less than five thousand

rupees an

d which may extend to ten thousand rupees.

(3) Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or any rule or order made thereunder,

consumes any intoxicant, shall be punished with fine which shall not be less than one

thousand

namely:-

rupees and which may extend to two thousend rupees.”
12. After section 60 of the principal Act the following section shall be inserted,

"60A. Whoever, adulterates or causes to be adulterated any intoxicant

f,ﬁ%‘g for - "py mixing any other substance or foreign ingredient to meke
noxious such intoxicant noxious or sells, offers or makes or causes to be

substance with
intoxicant snd sold or offered or made available such noxious intoxicant or any

selling of other noxious substance for consumption in the garb of an
;’3{,‘;&:& intoxicant, likely to cause disability or hurt or grievous hurt or

under the garb  death or any other consequential mjury to humanbeings, shall be
of intoxicant punished:;

(a) If as a result of such an act, death is caused, with death or
‘imprisonment for life and shall also be liable v fine which may extend to ten

!akh rupees but shall not be less than five lakh rupees;

(bj if as a result of such an act, disability or grievous hurt is caused, with
imprisonment for life or rigorous imprisonment which may extend to ten years
but shall not be less than six years and with fine which may extent to five lakh
rupees but shull nut be Jesy than'three lekh rupess,

(¢) it as a result of such an act, any hurt or any other consequential injury
is caused to any person, with imprisonment for a term which may extend t two
years but shall not be less than one year and fine which may extend to twe lakh
fifty thousand rapees but shall not be less than one lakh twenty five thousand
rupees.

. Explanation:~ For the purpose of this section the expression "hurt and
grievousehurt” shall have the same meaning as in section 319 and section 320
respectively of the Indian Penal Code, 1860 (Act no. XLV of 1860)."

13. In sccnon 62.0f the. principal Act for the words "liable to fine which may

extend to five thodsand rupees™ the words "liable 10 fine which shall not be less than five
thousand rupees aqd which may extend'to ten thousand rupees.” shall be substituted.

14. For section 63 of the principal Act the following section shall be substituted,

namely:- .

ane e

"63. Whoever, in contravention of this Act, or of any rule or order made
Penalty for thereunder, imports any intoxicant or transports or has in his
‘.l‘:";;‘r'f‘;‘r possession any quantity of any intoXicant unlawfully imported,
intoxicantang Shall be punished with imprisonment which shall not be less
wansportor  than six months and which may extend to five years and also
5';?:3;:;’; °f \ith fine which shall not be less than ten times the amount of
imported excise duty or consideration fee under section 30 which would
intoxicantefe.  have been leviable if such intoxicant had been dealt with in

accordance with this Act and the rules and orders made
thereunder or in accordance with any license, permit or pass

obtained thereunder or five thousand rupees whichever is greater."

Scanned by CamScanner

Insertion of
new section
60A

Amendment of
section 62

Amendment of
section 63



10 QN W /WY TNiC, 6 STEY), 2018

Amendment of . 15. In section 64 of the principal Act for clause( ¢) the following clause shall -

BHlEnes = be substituted, namely:-
"(c) save in a case provided for by section 60, willfully contravenes any
rule made under sections 40 and 41 shall, for each such offence, be punished
with fine which shall not be less than one thousand rupees and which may

extend to five thousand rupees.”

Amendmentaf 16. In section 64-A of the principal Act,~
section 64-A . ' o
(a) sub-section (1) shall be omitted;
-(b) in sub-section(2) for the words "two thousand rupees” the words
e "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted, .

(c) in the proviso to sub-section (2) for the words.'two hundred rupees”
the words "two thousand rupees” and for the words "five hundred rupees” the
: words "three thousand rupees” shall be subsritured.
Amend : -
sm?:ﬂ'gsc’“ of | 17. In section 65 of the principal Act,- |
" (a) in sub-section (1) for the words "six months" the words "one year"

ahd_ for the words "two thousand rupees” the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted. ‘ '

- (b) in sub-section (2) for the words "five hundred rupees” the words
. "one thousand rupees” shall be substituted. :
- Amendment of 18. In section 66 of the principal Act for the words "three months" the words

section 66 "one year" and for the words "five hundred rupees” the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substitutad. )

Amendment of 19. In section 67 of the vP.'—?-iPﬁiB@I;A‘iEJ‘!’; the words "three months" the words

section 67 "one year" and for the words':ﬂv&hm‘ldre&rupws” the words "five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted. A S . a oo

Amgndrggm of 20. In section 68 of the principal Act for the. words:"Siygdnadr es” the

section word "five thousand rupees" shall be substituted.. *+s..i it tor 1175 K Sheeay

Amendment of 21. In section 69 of the principal Act, in the first proviso for the words “three

section 63 months" the words "one year", and:for the words "one year" the words "two years"

' shall be substituted. - . -
Amendment of - 22. In section 69-A of the principal Act for the words letters and figures
section 69-A »clause (b), ciause (d), clause ( €) or clause (g) of sub-section (1) or of sub-séction (2)

k of section 60 or of section 62" thé words and figures "section 60, section 60-A,

section 62, section 63 or of section 65" shall’be substituted.
Amendment of 23. In section 70 of the principal Act,- :
section 70 (a) in “sub-section (1) for clause (a) the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:- :
"(a) of an offence punishable under section 60, :section 60-A,
section 62, section 63, section 64-A, section 65 or section 69-B,
except on his own knowledge or suspicion or on the complaint or report
of an Excise Officer; or”
(b) for sub-section (2) the following sub-section shall be substitured,
namely:- : . ]
"(2) Except with the special sanction of the State Government no
Magistrate shall take cognizance of any offence punishable 'under this Act
.other than an offence committed or abetted under, sub-sections (a) and
(b) of section 60-A and sectiqn 67, unless the prosecution is instituted
within a year affer the date on which the offence is alleged to have been - ¢

: committed. " , ' :
Amendment of 24. In section 71 of the principal Act,-
seation 7l (8) for the word and figures "section 60" the words and figures

"section 60, section 60-A:' shall be s;glg.,vtir_uled; '

Scanned by CamScanner



| SR T3 AR Tore, 6 s, 2018
(b) for the proviso the

following proviso shall be substituted, namely:-

" Provided that, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in
fo:s 6014 a.nd 6-98. No person other than the actual offender shall be
~ Punished with imprisonment except in default of payments of fine."

2.5. In section 72 of the principal Act for sub-
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

section (2) the following Amendment of

section 72
(2) Where anything or animal is sejzed under any provision of this Act, the

| ?rfc,f:e;] :e;zaltr;go?nsc‘ijcc}ileixir;iur:isugh -pro‘pe.rty shall, within thre? working days
: and detention; produce a detailed report for
confiscation alongwith such seized property, seizure memo and other relevant:
G documents before the Collector. The Collector shah, upon receiving the -said
report alongwith seizure memo and seized property, immediately order for safe
custody and storage of goods as he may deem fit. The Collector, if satisfied for
reasons to.be.recorded that an offence has been committed due to which such thing or
animal has become liable to confiscation undér sub-section (1), he may order
confiscation of such thing or animal whether or not a prosecution for such offence has

et

been instituted:;

Provided that in the case of anything (except an intoxicant) or anirna) referred
to in sub-section (1), the owner thereof shall be given an option to pay in lieu of its

confiscation such fine as the Collector thinks adequate, not exceeding its market value
[ 2 .

vl on the date of its seizure.”

L

26, For, section.73-A of the principal Act the following sectiort shall be , Amendmentof
substituted, namely:-

section 73A

the Collector, may, subject to any order passed in that behalf by any court if in
his opinion the confiscated intoxicant is not fit for human consumption or if
the confiscated intoxicant cannot'be'stored or preserved, order the intoxicant
to be destroyed notwithstanding anything to the contrary contzined in this Act:

2 .

ﬂ , "73-A Where any intoxicant is confiscated under section 72 or section 73,
{

!{.-

H

}

; Provided that the intoxicant shall not be destroyed except after expiration
! of two mahths fiom the date of confiscation or where an application for review

or an appeal against the order of confiscation is pending except in accordarice
with the order passed in such, review or appeal in this regard:

~ . ’ ' ; : 3
; Provided further that any order for destruction of the intoxicant under

this section shall not be passed without providing opportunity of hearing
affer notice of sevgn, days to the person from whose custody the intoxicant

isTecovered: |

LI IR N

Provided also. that ,ad_c‘qu;;gg;xls_gmgl'eitq,f the intoxicant shall be preserved to
.meet the evidentiary requirements." ,

27. In section 74 of the principal Act} o

e e e g A e

Amendment of

o ) .. section 74
(a) in sub-section (1) for the words "five thousand rupees” the words
i

"fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted,
(b) in sub-section (I-A),-

(i) for the words and letter "under clause (a)" the words and letters
"under clauses (a) and (b)" shall be substituted;
‘ ,

(ii) for the words "fifty rupees which may extend to three hundred

rupees” the words "one thousand rupees which may extend to five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

Scanned by CamScanner



12 IR A IR TOE, 6 STasl, 2018
Amendment of 28. In section 74-A of the principal Act, in sub-section (1) for the
200N =60 words "five thousand rupees" the words "one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted.
Repeal and saving 29. (1) The Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ofdim‘"“’ 2017 is g,;}m“
hereby repealed. no. 1 of
2017

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action
taken under the provisions of the principal Act as amended by the
Ordinance referred to in sub-section (1) shall be deemed-to have been
done or taken under the coresponding provisions of the principal Act as
amended by this Act as if the provisions of this Act were in force at all

material times. S

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Excise Department is the second largest department after Commercial Tax Department in the
State. In the year 2016-2017 Rupees 14,272 crore only were earned by the Excise Department. In the
previous years the revenue receipt had been reduced relatively to the target fixed. The main reason for the
said reduction was the smuggling of illegal liquor from the neighboring States particularly from Haryana.
Similarly, the extraction of 1llegal liquor in the State has caused not only the loss of the revenue of the
State but also incidents of the loss of lives of the people due to the consumption of such illegal and
poisonous liquor. In order to prevent such incidents and other problems relating to the excise matters it has
been decided to amend the United Provinces Excise Act,-l910 mainly to provide for,-
(1)making the penal provisions oftfxe said Act more stringent;
(2) making provisions for realising consideration fee as Excise duty;
(3) abolishing the provisions relating to the maximum limit of Excise duty with effect from
Apr.il 1,2016;
. (4) omitting the provisions re.]ating to Charas and Ganja from the United Provinces Excise
Act, 1910 because of their mclusnon in the Narcotic Drugs and Psychotropic Substances
-~ Act, 1985;
(5) including the abetment in the penal offences.
~ Smce the State Legislature was not in session and immediate legislative action was necessary to
u’nplcmem the aforesaid decision, the Uttar Pradesh Excise (Amendment) Ordinance, 2017 (U.P.
Ordinance no. | of 2017) was promulgated by the Governor on September 27, 2017.

-2. This Bill is introduced to replace the aforesaid Ordinance accordingly.

By order,
VIRENDRA KUMAR SRIVASTAVA,
Pramukh Sachiv.

Hovwogodio—Too 796 ATTH—(R)-2018—(2501)-509 ST~ (FRYER /& / IR |
fogwogofio—vodo 157 o Remdl-2018—(2502)-300 SRrI—(FER /& / AHRE) |

Scanned by CamScanner

\Y

o s ¥ S I Sl S



